
From: Devkota, Om
To: Jessica Milam
Cc: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Mendez, Lucia; Joe Villari
Subject: RE: Villari Food Group Docket No. EPCRA-04-2021-0607(b)
Date: Tuesday, August 10, 2021 9:16:56 AM
Attachments: image002.png

Good morning Ms. Milam,
 
Thank you for the email. This email confirms the receipt of the payment informations. The
administrative matter is formally closed. Please let me or Lucia know if you have any questions.
 
I hope you have a great week.
 
Regards,
 
Om P. Devkota                 
U.S. EPA, Region 4
Phone: (404) 562-8963
 

From: Jessica Milam <jessica.m@vfgmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 9, 2021 10:20 AM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Devkota, Om
<devkota.om@epa.gov>
Cc: Jessica Milam <jessica.m@vfgmail.com>
Subject: Villari Food Group Docket No. EPCRA-04-2021-0607(b)
Importance: High
 
To whom it may concern,
 
I have attached proof of payment for the fines and penalties we incurred for our Villari Food
Group LLC facility as stated in Docket No. EPCRA-04-2021-0607(b).
 
These two checks will be going out today via Priority Mail with the US Postal Service, according
to the mailing instructions we were provided in the docket.  Please let us know if there are any
issues receiving these checks.
 
Thank you, 
 
Jessica Milam
Accounting Manager
Villari Food Group, LLC
(910)293-6548
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From: Scans <scans@vfgmail.com>
Sent: Monday, August 9, 2021 10:52 AM
To: Jessica Milam <jessica.m@vfgmail.com>
Subject: Message from VBFAcct1
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